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I can't believe someone took the time to put out a Cutting Crew DVD. I mean, 
really, the only song most people really care about is "I Just Died In Your Arms 
Tonight," which was a pretty cool tune if I do say so myself. Hell, I'll be honest 
with you, I heard that song on the radio and I liked it enough to actually go out 
and buy their album. It wasn't too bad. At the time, I thought they were a 2nd rate 
version of Duran Duran. Remember, this was back in 1985. So, that was the 
opinion of a teen who was more into the whole glam/hair metal scene. 

Anyway, this concert comes from a German television show. So, you know it's 
gonna be a good quality show. You're just not getting the full Cutting Crew 
concert experience because, unfortunately, it's only an eight song performance. 
But, look on the bright side...you get some of the Cutting Crew's best material, 
which inclueds "Fear Of Falling," "I've Been In Love Before," "One For The 
Mocking Bird" and, of course, "I Just Died In Your Arms Tonight." So, it's a nice, 
quick blast from the past for those of you who might have been into 80's pop 
music. 

Also featured on this release is a five minute interview with Nick van Eede and 
Kevin Scott Macmichael which, to be honest, was kind of a pain in the ass to 
watch. Because of the language difference, you've got one voice speaking in 
English and another voice talking in German. Now, I usually complain about 
having to "read" anything on the television. But, in this case, I think sub-titles 
would have been a much better choice. But, then again, it's only a five minute 
interview and, it's not like you're not learning anything new about the band. You 
can find more information on them by doing a quick search on the internet. 
Besides, the concert more than makes up for it. 

http://www.ARD-VIDEO.de 
http://www.myspace.com/cuttingcrewmusic 

 


